
Welcome!

Miramar Systems has put together this DEMONSTRATION version of PC MACLAN v6.1, for 
you to sample some of the advantages of cross platform networking. Miramar System’s PC 
MACLAN for Windows 95 will share files, printers, hard drives and other network resources. 
The software will run across ethernet, local talk, and Token Ring type topologies.  Miramar 
Systems also offers Personal MACLAN Connect a software solution for Windows 3.x users.

To operate the Miramar Demo package, follow all installation instructions completely.  NO 
serial number is required for the Demo version. This is a timed out demonstration, the time 
available is approximately 30 minutes.  Printed copies going through the PC MACLAN Demo 
will be water marked.  The User Manual is in PDF ( Portable Document Format) and Miramar 
has included the installer for Adobe’s Acrobat Reader for your convenience.  The CD also 
includes a method to create PC MACLAN v6.1 install disks for those users who do not have a 
CD drive.  You will need to have an operational hardware network running between the PC and 
Macintosh to run PC MACLAN.  There is no additional software required for the Macintosh, as 
long as System 7 and AppleShare is installed.

Miramar Systems will be announcing additional cross platform software solutions later this year.
For those telecommuters or people who work at home but need to access a Macintosh network, 
Miramar will announce a Remote package that will dial up into a Macintosh network from a 
Windows 95 PC.  This will let the PC user send print jobs, transfer files, and access resources on
the Macintosh network.  Windows NT 4.0 users will be happy to hear that Miramar will release 
a full bi-directional networking solution, that will enable them to share files, printer and other 
network resources between Windows NT 4.0 ( workstation & Server) and a Macintosh network. 
In addition to these packages Miramar Systems will be adding IP functionality to the existing PC
MACLAN for Windows 95.  This will offer the Windows 95 user the ability to connect to a 
AppleShare 5.0 IP workstation or server, by using an IP address.  More flexibility to work in the
environment YOU choose is what Miramar Systems is all about.

For more information on any of these solutions please contact Miramar Sales, 800 862 2526 or 
Email us at: sales@miramarsys.com.


