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SPECRAIL RESIDENTIAL GRADE FENCE SYSTEM
RESIDENTIAL WIDE PICKET RAIL SYSTEM

PP-PRODUCT PRESENTATION

SYSTEM FEATURES

Specrail Residential (SR) aluminum fencing offers a combination of durability, strength and clean
appearance, and will keep their attractive finish over a lifetime. Specrail’s residential grade fence 
is the perfect choice to complement any architectural or landscape design. Like all Specrail 
systems, matching gates are available for all of the styles.

Specrail Residential grade fencing is fully assembled in six foot (6') sections. Pickets are screwed 
to rails with stainless steel fasteners. Posts are prepunched to accept rails. Rails are connected to 
posts with stainless steel TEK screws. Sections will easily rake to allow for change in ground 
level. Field work is reduced to a minimum.

Specrail enhances its residential line further with its wide picket fence system. Applying the new 
system to Specrail residential grade lends an industrial appearance to your classic perimeter.

UA-USES, APPLICATIONS

APPLICATIONS

The Specrail Residential grade fence system can be applied to a wide range of residential uses. To
define residential property lines, or enclose a swimming pool, Specrail fence will provide safety, 
function and beauty for years to come.

In accordance with local municipal swimming pool BOCA codes Specrail has developed a style 
54 inches tall to meet or exceed these codes.

TS-TECHNICAL SUPPORT

TECHNICAL/DESIGN ASSISTANCE

Specrail’s staff includes an engineering and drafting department to assist contractors/architects 
with any design question that may arise in the specification of the Specrail systems. Specrail 
prides itself in fast dependable customer service. Specrail will expeditiously deliver any design 



assistance necessary to make your job a success.

CC-CODES, CERTIFICATION

WARRANTY

Specrail issues a lifetime limited warranty with every fence system sold. Specrail warrants that 
their fence will remain serviceable and structurally sound for lifetime. In addition, Specrail 
guarantees its electrostatically applied organically painted fence for lifetime from the date of 
purchase. Specrail guarantees the finish will not crack, check, or peel (lose adhesion).

The aforementioned warranty denotes Specrail’s confidence in the longevity of its fencing 
systems. Combined superior construction with inherent material capabilities of aluminum, 
stainless steel and thermoset acrylic enamel afford Specrail this opportunity to serve as a 
guarantor of its products.

MF-MATERIALS, FINISHES

FACTORY APPLIED COATING

All Specrail fence systems are finished in Polycolor, our premium High Solids Acrylic coating. 
Polycolor is designed for outstanding durability, and hardness. Polycolor meets AAMA 603.8 
specifications. Specrail offers its fence system in six (6) standard colors, with optional custom 
capabilities for color matching.

Specrail finishes all of its fencing and hardware products in compliance with the most stringent 
codes of t he Environmental Protection Agency. Specrail employs the finest known methods in 
the industry to pre-treat, and finish its aluminum fencing under it’s codes. The finished product is 
environmentally safe and recyclable.

Specrail is a charter member of ASCA, the Architectural Spray Coaters Association, and is 
committed to the highest standards of metal finishing operations.

CP-COMPONENTS, PARTS

GATES & HARDWARE

Specrail gates are available for all Specrail Grade Fencing Systems. Gates will conform in style 
to fence sections. Specrail utilizes matching material to the fencing system in fabrication of gates,
insuring conformity in style. Corner supports are incorporated to add rigidity to every Specrail 
gate.

Walk gates, cantilever gates and double drive gates are available in varied widths to 
accommodate exacting needs for gate application. All Specrail hardware is fabricated of 
aluminum alloy components and finished to match fencing and gates. All applicable self closing 
hardware is supplied with each gate.

CP-COMPONENTS, PARTS

ACCESSORIES



Specrail stocks a complete line of decorative accessories to add design flair to any Specrail grade 
fence. Among accessories available are finials in two styles for installation on picket points. Ball 
caps are available as an alternative to the traditional post caps. Finials & ball caps are supplied to 
match fence color, or in a bright gold paint.

Scrolls of varying design and height can also be added by simple assembly to mid section pickets.
Initials are available for fence enhancement as well. Like the finials, the accessories finish will 
match the fence, or is available in Gold.

All accessories are aluminum cast pieces and carry the same warranty against corrosion as do all 
Specrail products. Some of Specrail’s decorative and functional accessories are outlined on page 
7 of Sweet’s printed catalog 02830/SPE. Please call Specrail customer service for a more 
complete listing of available castings and custom items.


