
JR's RECIFILER FOR WINDOWS DOCUMENTATION:

AUTHOR:  

John P. Robinson
1025 Odus Drive
Jackson, MO  63755

PRICE:

$9.95 plus shipping/handling and sales tax where applicable.  To order a registered version press 
the REGISTER button on the demo version of the program or press the REGISTER A FRIEND 
button on the registered version of the program.  This will print out an order form which can be
mailed to the above address.
NOTE:  The demo version of the program has the SAVE button disabled.  This will allow you to 
see exactly how the program works without buying it. 

SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS:  

IBM PC AT or compatible running Microsoft Windows.

DISCLAIMER:

Great care has been taken to make sure that this program will not endanger your system; 
however, the author assumes no responsibility for damage or lost data due to the use or mis-use 
of this program or the program disk contents.

QUESTIONS/COMMENTS:

Please address any questions or comments to the author's address above.  I will reply to 
registered users' questions and comments as soon as possible.

INTRODUCTION:

The goal of this recipe storage program was to create a very simple, easy to use method of 
storing, retrieving, editing and printing your personal recipes.  

There are many advantages to storing your recipes in your computer verses the traditional 
cardbox.  You can easily print out a new copy of your recipe when you need it and not worry if you
spill something on it.  A recipe can be easily found and grouped into recipe categories.  Also, how 
many times has a friend asked for a recipe and you never got it to them because you didn't want 
to take the time to write it out.  The computer will allow you to print them a copy quickly and 
easily.

CONTROL BUTTONS:

SHOW NAMES:  When you press this button, the program will show all of your recipe names in 
alphabetical order.  After this list is displayed you may choose to show only the recipes in a 
particular category by pressing one of the recipe type buttons.  This will help you find the recipe 
you are looking for quickly and easily.  When you see the recipe name you are looking for just 
double click on that name with the left mouse button and that recipe will be displayed.  If you just 



want to print that recipe and not display it, just highlight the recipe name by clicking on the name 
once with the left mouse button and then pressing the PRINT button.

NEXT:  Pressing this button will advance you to the next recipe in the file.

BACK:  Pressing this button will display the previous recipe in the file.

FIRST:  This button will display the first recipe in the file.

LAST:  This button will display the last recipe in the file.

SEARCH:  When you press this button the computer will ask you to enter a word to search.  This 
can be very useful on occasion.  For instance, if you had some chicken and wanted to look at all 
of your recipes with chicken in them, you could enter 'chicken' when the computer asks you to 
enter a word to search.  The computer starts at the beginning of the recipe file and searches the 
recipe text and name for the word chicken.  When it finds the first one it displays the recipe on the
screen.  Also at that time a 'FIND NEXT' button will appear at the bottom right hand corner of the 
screen.  After viewing the first recipe you may then press the FIND NEXT button to see the next 
recipe with chicken in it.  You can keep repeating this procedure until the computer has searched 
all the recipes.  The search function could also be useful if you can't remember a recipe name but
can remember one of the ingredients.  You could enter that ingredient into the search and find the
recipe very quickly.

ADD:  Pressing this button will clear the screen and allow you to enter a new recipe into the file.  
At any time before, during, or after entering your recipe text you may press one of the category 
buttons on the right side of the screen to place this recipe into the respective category.
NOTE:  Your recipe must have a name.  The computer will not let you store any recipes without a 
name.

DELETE:  This button will delete the current recipe being viewed on the screen.

PRINT:  This button will send the current recipe on the screen to the default windows printer.

SAVE:  Any time you change or add any information to the recipe file the SAVE button will appear
right next to the QUIT button.  Pressing this will save any changes or additions you have made to 
the recipe file.  If you forget to save your changes and just press the QUIT button a message box 
will appear asking you if you want to save your changes.
NOTE:  The current recipe file is saved on the hard disk as 'RECIFILE.DAT'.  The previously 
saved recipe file is saved on the hd as 'RECIFILE.OLD'.

QUIT:  This button will end the program.

CHANGE TYPE:  Pressing this button will allow you to change the type of the current recipe 
being displayed.

EDITING A RECIPE:  To edit a recipe just click anywhere in the recipe text or name with the 
mouse and a cursor will appear for you to edit your text.

CUT, COPY, and PASTE TEXT:  Any text in your recipe file can be transferred or copied from one
place to another by using the CUT, COPY, and PASTE commands.  First highlight the text you 
want to be copied or transferred with the mouse by dragging the mouse over any area of text 
while holding down the left mouse button.  Next press CTRL-C combination to copy that text into 
memory.  Then move to the area where you want the copied text to be placed and press CTRL-V.
Your copied text will appear at that spot.  If you wish to transfer the text and not copy, just use 
CTRL-X instead of CTRL-C.



BACK UP YOUR DATA!!!   The file called RECIFILE.DAT contains data for all of your recipes.  
You should copy this file to a floppy disk occasionally so you can recover your recipes should 
your hard drive crash.  This file can be found in the same directory where you installed the 
program.

THANK YOU!  for viewing or purchasing this product!


