
Name of Scholarship:  brief summary, deadline

**See Ms. Dayton with questions about all scholarships***

St. Kate’s has a very good list of scholarships available to all students (not just St. 
Kate’s students).  It is updated frequently and there is some overlap of scholarships 
posted here, but there are also many additional scholarships available!
http://minerva.stkate.edu/financialaid2.nsf/schol_list?OpenForm

NE MN Office of Job Training Scholarship:  Seniors attending a 2 year technical college 
and majoring in a career in a high-demand occupation (LPN, Engineering, etc.).  Based 
on financial need.  Up to $4,000/year for two years.  Applications in Ms. Dayton’s office.  
Apply early!

American Legion Scholarship & Financial Aid Info:  For some great scholarships and 
financial aid information, visit  www.legion.org/needalift

Members Cooperative Credit Union (Community Youth Foundation):  Four scholarships 
of $1,000 each will be awarded to area youth.  Applications may be downloaded from 
www.membersccu.org  Deadline: March 31st, 2013

SFM Foundation:  Children of parents who have been killed on the job.  Up to $5,000/yr.  
Deadline: March 31st, 2013  www.sfm-foundation.org

MN Association of Townships:  Current 11th graders.  A written essay is required.  (4 
scholarships) of $1,000 each.  Application in Ms. Dayton’s office.  Deadline: May 1st, 
2013

Minnesota State High School Clay Target League:  Seniors who are a member of a 
participating MSHSCTL team in spring 2013 and wanting to continue their education in 
the field of environmental sciences or conservation.  Deadline: May 1st, 2013  
Application and more information at http://www.mnclaytarget.com/2013-scholarship-
program-announced/ 

Society of Women Engineers Freshman Scholarship Program:  Senior women who will 
be attending a 4 year college and studying either engineering or computer sciences.  
Scholarship amounts range from $1,000-$7,000.  Go to www.swe.org and click on the 
“Scholarships” tab for the application.  Deadline: May 15th, 2013 

Whole Person Scholarship:  Seniors attending Oral Roberts University only.  Check it 
out at www.wholeperson.oru.edu
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Model College of Hair Design:  Those attending this college in St. Cloud, I have a 
$2,000 scholarship for anyone who visits the college and then attends.  Come see Ms. 
Dayton for info
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