Section 153. Cross references

(1) For definitions of "husband” and "wi fe", as used in
section 152(b)(4), see section 7701(a)(17).

(2) For deductions of estates and trusts, if lieu of the
exenpti ons under section 151, see section 642(b).

(3) For exenptions of nonresident aliens, see section 873

(b) (3).
(4) For determnation of marital status, see section 7703.

Section 161. Al l owance of deductions

I n conputing taxable income under section 63, there shall be
al | oned as deductions the itens specified in this part, subject
to the exceptions provided in part | X (section 261 and fol |l ow ng,
relating to itens not deductible).

211. Al l owance of deductions

I n conputing taxable income under section 63, there shall be
al | oned as deductions the itens specified in this part, subject
to the exceptions provided in part | X (section 261 and the
following, relating to itens not deductible).

212. Expenses for production of incone

In the case of an individual, there shall be allowed as a
deduction all the ordinary and necessary expenses paid or
i ncurred during the taxable year --

(1) for the production or collection of incone;

(2) for the managenent, conservation, or naintenance of
property held for the production of incone; or

(3) in connection with the determ nation, collection, or
refund of any tax.

213. Medical, dental, etc., expenses

(a) Allowance of deduction. -- There shall be allowed as a
deducti on the expenses paid during the taxable year, not
conpensat ed for by insurance or otherw se, for nedical care of
t he taxpayer, his spouse, or a dependent (as defined in section
152), to the extent that such expenses exceed 7.5 percent of
adj usted gross incone.

(b) Limtation with respect to nedicine and drugs. -- An
amount paid during the taxable year for nedicine or a drug shal
be taken into account under subsection (a) only if such nedicine
or drug is a prescribed drug or is insulin.

(c) Special rule for decedents. --

(1) Treatnent of expenses paid after death. -- For purposes
of subsection (a), expenses for the nedical care of the taxpayer
whi ch are paid out of his estate during the 1l-year period
beginning with the day after the date of his death shall be
treated as paid by the taxpayer at the time incurred.

(2) Limtation. -- Paragraph (1) shall not apply if the anpunt
paid is all owabl e under section 2053 as a deduction in conputing



the taxabl e estate of the decedent, but this paragraph shall no
apply if (wwthin the time and in the nmanner and form prescri bed
by the Secretary) there is filed --

(A) a statenent that such anmount has not been allowed as a
deducti on under section 2053, and

(B) a waiver of the right to have such anmount all owed at
any time as a deduction under section 2053.

(d) Definitions. -- for purposes of this section --

(1) The term "nedical care"” neans anounts paid --

(A) for the diagnosis, cure, mtigation, treatnent, or
prevention of disease, or for the purpose of affecting any
structure or function of the body,

(B) for transportation primarily for and essential to
nmedi cal care referred to in subparagraph (A), or

(© for insurance (including anbunts paid as prem uns under
part B of title XVIII of the Social Security Act, relating to
suppl ementary nedi cal insurance for the aged) covering nedial
care referred to in subparagraphs (A) and (B)

(2) Amounts paid for certain |odging away from hone treated
as paid for nedical care. -- Amounts paid for |odging (not |avish
or extravagant under the circunstances) while away from hone
primarily for and essential to nedical care referred to in
paragraph (1) (A) shall be treated as anmounts paid for medica
care if --

(A) the nedical care referred to in paragraph (1)(A) is
provided by a physician in a licensed hospital (or in a nedical
care facility which is related to, or the equivalent of, a
| i censed hospital), and
(B) there is no significant el ement of personal pleasure,
recreation, or vacation in the travel away from hone.

The amount taken into account under the precedi ng sentence shal
not exceed $50 for each night for each individual.

(3) Prescribed drug. -- The term "prescribed drug" neans a
drug or biological which requires a prescription of a physician
for its use by an individual.

(4) Physician. -- The term "physician" has the neaning
given to such termby section 1861(r) of the Social Security Act
(42 U.S.C. 1395x(r)).

(5) Special rule in the case of child of divorced parents,
etc. -- Any child to whom section 152(e) applies shall be treated
as a dependent of both parents for purposes of this section.

(6) In the case of an insurance contract under which
amounts are payable for other than nedical care referred to in
subparagraphs (A) and (B) of paragraph (1) --

(A) no anpbunt shall be treated as paid for insurance to
whi ch paragraph (1) (C) applies unless the charge for such
i nsurance is either separately stated in the contract, or
furnished to the policyholder by the insurance conpany in a
separ ate statenent,

(B) the amount taken into account as the anmount paid for
such insurance shall not exceed such charge, and

(© no anpbunt shall be treated as paid for such insurance
i f the amount specified in the contract (or furnished to the
pol i cyhol der by the insurance conmpany in a separate statenent) as



t he charge for such insurance is unreasonably large in relation
to the total charges under the contract.

(7) Subject to the limtations of paragraph (6), prem unms
pai d during the taxable year by a taxpayer before he attains the
age of 65 for insurance covering nedical care (within the nmeaning
of subparagraphs (A) and (B) of paragraph (1)) for the taxpayer,
hi s spouse, or a dependent after the taxpayer attains the age of
65 shall be treated as expenses paid during the taxable year for
i nsurance whi ch constitutes nmedical care if premuns for such
i nsurance are payable (on a | evel paynent basis) under the
contract for a period of 10 years or nore or until the year in
whi ch the taxpayer attains the age of 65 (but in no care for a
period of less than 5 years).

(8) The determ nation of whether an individual is nmarried
at any tinme during the taxable year shall be nmade in accordance
Wi th the provisions of section 6013(d) (relating to determ nation
of status as husband and wife).

(9) Cosnetic surgery. --

(A) In general. -- The term "nedical care" does not include
cosnmetic surgery or other simlar procedure, unless the surgery
or procedure is necessary to aneliorate a deformty arising from
or directly related to, a congenital abnormality, a personal
injury resulting froman accident or trauma, or disfiguring
di sease.

(B) <cosnetic surgery defined. -- For purposes of this
paragraph, the term"cosnetic surgery” means any procedure which
Is directed at inproving the patient's appearance and does not
meani ngful ly pronote the proper function of the body or prevent
or treat illness or disease.

(e) Exclusion of amounts allowed for care of certain
dependents. -- Any expense allowed as a credit under section 21
shall not be treated as an expense paid for nedical care.

(f) Coordination with health insurance credit under section
32. -- The anount otherw se taken into account under subsection
(a) as expenses for nedical care shall be reduced by the anount

if any) of the health insurance credit allowable to the taxpayer
for the taxable year under section 32.

215. Alinony, etc., paynents

(a) GCeneral rule. -- In the case of an individual, there
shal |l be allowed as a deduction an nount equal to the alinony or
separ at e mai nt enance paynents paid during such individual's
t axabl e year.

(b) Alinony or separate maintenance paynents defined. --
for purposes of this section, the term"alinony or separate
mai nt enance paynent" means any al i nony or separate mai nt enance
paynment ( as defined in section 71(b)) which is includible in the
gross inconme of the recipient under section 71

(c) Requirenent of identification nunber. -- The Secretary
may prescribe regul ati ons under which --

(1) any individual receiving alinony or separate
mai nt enance paynents is required to furnish such individual's
t axpayer identification nunber to the individual maki ng such
paynments, and



(2) the individual nmaking such paynments is required to
i ncl ude such taxpayer identification nunmber on such individual's
return for the taxable year in which such paynents are nade.

(d) coordination with section 682. -- No deduction shall be
al | oned under this section with respect to any paynent if, by
reason of section 682 (relating to incone of alinony trusts), the
amount thereof is not includible in such individual's gross
i ncone.

216. Deduction of taxes, interest, and business depreciation
by cooperative housing corporation tenant-stockhol der

(a) Allowance of deduction. -- In the case of a tenant-
st ockhol der (as defined in subsection (b)(2)), there shall be
al | oned as a deduction anpbunts (not otherw se deductible) paid or
accrued to a cooperative housing corporation within the taxable
year, but only to the extent that such anmobunts represent the
t enant - st ockhol der' s proportionate share of --

(1) the real estate taxes allowable as a deduction to the
corporation under section 164 which are paid or incurred by the
corporation on the houses or apartnent building and on the | and
on whi ch such houses (or building) are situated, or

(2) the interest allowable as a deduction to the
corporation under section 163 which is paid or incurred by the
corporation on its indebtedness contracted --

(A) in the acquisition, construction, alteration,
rehabilitation, or maintenance of the houses or apartnent
bui | di ng, or

(B) in the acquisition of the and on which the houses (or
apartment buil ding) are situated.

(b) Definitions. -- for purposes of this section --

(1) cooperative housing corporation. -- The term
"cooperative housing corporation” nmeans a corporation--

(A) having one and only one class of stock outstanding,

(B) each of the stockholders of which is entitle, solely by
reason of his ownership of stock in the corporation, to occupy
for dwelling purposes a house, or an apartnent in a buil ding,
owned or | eased by such corporation, and

(© no stockhol der of which is entitled (either
conditionally or unconditionally) to receive any distribution not
out of earnings and profits of the corporation except on a
conplete or partial |iquidation of the corporation, and

(D) 80 percent or nore of the gross income of which for the
taxabl e year in which the taxes and interest described in
subsection (a) are paid or incurred is derived fromtenant-
st ockhol ders.

(2) Tenant-stockholder. -- The term "tenant-stockhol der”
nmeans a person who is a stockholder in a cooperative housing
cor poration, and whose stock is fully paid-up in an anount not
| ess than an anmount shown to the satisfaction of the Secretary as
bearing a reasonable relationship to the portion of the val ue of
the corporation's equity in the houses or apartnent building and
the land on which situated which is attributable to the house or
apartment which such person is entitled to occupy.

(3) Tenant-stockhol der's proportionate share. --



(A) In general.-- except as provided in subparagraph (B)
the term "tenant-stockhol der's proportionate share"” means that
proportion which the stock of the cooperative housing corporation
owned by the tenant-stockholder is of the total outstandi ng stock
of the corporation (including any stock held by the corporation)

(B) Special rule where allocation of taxes or interest
reflect cost to corporation of stockholder's unit. --

(i) In general. -- If, for any taxable year--

(I') each dwelling unit owned or | eased by a cooperative
housi ng corporation is separately allocated a share of such
corporation's real estate taxes described in subsection (a)(1) or
a share of such
corporation's interest described in subsection (a)(2), and

(I'l) such allocations reasonably reflect the cost to such
corporation of such taxes, or of such interest, attributable to
t he tenant-stock-holder's dwelling unit (and such unit's share of
t he conmon areas),

then the term "tenant-stockhol der's proportionate share"
means the share determ ned in accordance with the all ocations
descri bed in subclause (11).

(ii) Election by corporation required. -- Cause (i) shal
apply with respect to any cooperative housing corporation only if
such corporation elects its application. Such an election, once
made, may be revoked only with the consent of the Secretary.

(4) Stock owned by governnental units. -- For purposes of
this subsection, in determ ning whether a corporation is a
cooperative housing corporation, stock owned and apartnents
| eased by the United States or any of its possessions, a State or
any political subdivision thereof, or any agency or
instrumentality of the foregoing enpowered to acquire shares in a
cooperative housing corporation for the purpose of providing
housing facilities, shall not be taken into account.

(5) Prior approval of occupancy. -- For purposes of this
section, in the follow ng cases there shall not be taken into
account the fact that (by agreenent with the cooperative housing
corporation) the person or his nom nee may not occupy the house
or apartment without the prior approval of such corporation:

(A) In any case where a person acquires stock of
cooperative housing corporation by operation of |aw.

(B) In any case where a person other than an i ndividual
acqui res stock of a cooperative housing corporation.

(© In any case where the original seller acquires any
stock of the cooperative housing corporation fromthe corporation
not later than 1 year after the date on which the apartnents or
houses (or | easeholds therein) are transferred by the original
seller to the corporation

(6) Oiginal seller defined. -- For purposes of paragraph
(5), the term"original seller"” means the person from whomthe
corporation has acquired the apartnents or houses (or |easehol ds

t herein).
(c) Treatnent as property subject to depreciation. --
(1) In general. -- so nuch of the stock of a tenant-

st ockhol der in a cooperative housing corporation as is allocable,
under regul ations prescribed by the Secretary, to a proprietary



| ease or right of tenancy in property subject to the all owance
for depreciation under section 167(a) shall, to the extent such
proprietary | ease or right of tenancy is used by such tenant-
stockhol der in a trade or business or for the production of
i ncone, be treated as property subject to the all owance for
depreci ati on under section 167(a). The precedi ng sentence shal
no be construed to limt or deny a deduction for depreciation
under section 167(a) by a cooperative housing corporation with
respect to property owned by such a corporation and | eased to
t enant - st ockhol ders.

(2) Deduction limted to adjusted basis in stock. --

(A) In general. -- The anount of any deduction for
depreci ati on all owabl e under section 167(a) to a tenant-
st ockhol der with respect to any stock for any taxable year by
reason of paragraph (1) shall not exceed the adjusted basis of
such stock as of the close of the taxable year of the tenant-
st ockhol der in which such deduction was incurred.

(B) Carryforward of disallowed anount. -- The ampunt of any
deduction which is not allowed by reason of subparagraph (A)
shal |, subject to the provisions of subparagraph (A), be treated

as a deduction all owabl e under section 167(a) in the succeedi ng
t axabl e year.

(d) Disallowance of deduction for certain paynents to the
corporation. -- No deduction shall be allowed to a stockholder in
a cooperative housing corporation for any anmount paid or accrued
to such corporation during any taxable year (in excess of the
st ockhol der's proportionate share of the itens described in
subsections (a)(1l) and (a)(2) to the extent that, under
regul ati ons prescribed by the Secretary, such anmount is properly
al | ocable to amounts paid or incurred at any tinme by the
corporation which are chargeable to the corporation's capital
account. The stockhol der's adjusted basis in the stock in the
corporation shall be increased by the anbunt of such
di sal | owance.

(e) Distributions by cooperative housing corporations. --
Except as provided in regulations, no gain or |oss shall be
recogni zed on the distribution by a cooperative housing
corporation of a dwelling unit to a stockhol der in such
corporation if such corporation if such distributionis in
exchange for the stockholder's stock in such corporation and such
exchange qualifies for nonrecognition of gain under section 1034

f).

217. Movi ng expenses

(a) Deduction allowed. -- There shall be allowed as a
deducti on novi ng expenses paid or incurred during the taxable
year in connection with the commencenent of work by the taxpayer
as an enpl oyee or as a self-enployed individual at a new
principal place of work.

(b) Definition of noving expenses. --

(1) In general. -- For purposes of this section, the term
"nmovi ng expenses” neans only the reasonabl e expenses --

(A) of noving househol d goods and personal effects fromthe
former residence to the new residence,



(B) of traveling (including neals and | odging) fromthe
former residence to the new place of residence,

(© of traveling (including neals and | odging), after
obt ai ni ng enpl oynment, fromthe former residence to the general
| ocation of the new principal place of work and return, for the
princi pal purpose of searching for a new residence,

(D) of neals and | odgi ng while occupying tenporary quarters
in the general |ocation of the new principal place of work during
any period of 30 consecutive days after obtaining enploynent, or

(E) constituting qualified residence sale, purchase, or
| ease expenses.

(2) Qualified residence sale, etc., expenses. -- For
pur poses of paragraph (1)(E), the term"qualified residence sale,
purchase, or | ease expenses" neans only reasonabl e expenses
I ncident to --

(A) the sale or exchange by the taxpayer or his spouse of
t he taxpayer's fornmer residence (not including expenses for work
performed on such residence in order to assist in its sale) which
(but for this subsection and subsection (e)) would be taken into
account in determning the amount realized on the sale or
exchange,

(B) the purchase by the taxpayer or his spouse of a new
residence in the general |ocation of the new principal place of
wor k which (but for this subsection and subsection (e)) would be
taken into account in determning --

(1) the adjusted basis of the new residence, or

(i1) the cost of a loan (but not including any anounts
whi ch represent paynents or prepaynents of interest),

(C the settlenment of an unexpired | ease held by the
t axpayer or his spouse on property used by the taxpayer as his
f ormer residence, or

(D) the acquisition of a | ease by the taxpayer or his
spouse on property used by the taxpayer as his new residence in
t he general |ocation of the new principal place of work (not
i ncl udi ng anounts which are paynents or prepaynents of rent).

(3) Limtations. --

(A) Dollar limts. -- The aggregate anount allowable as a
deducti on under subsection (a) in connection with a commencenent
of work which is attributable to expenses described in
subparagraph (C) or (D) of paragraph (1) shall not exceed $1,
500. The aggregate anount all owable as a deduction under
subsection (a) which is attributable to qualified residence sale,
purchase, or |ease expenses shall not exceed $3,000, reduced by
t he aggregate anount so allowable which is attributable to
expenses described in subparagraph (C) or (D) of paragraph (1).

(B) Husband and wife. -- If a husband and wife both
conmence work at a new principal place of work within the sane
general | ocation, subparagraph (A) shall be applied as if there
was only one conmencenent of work. |In the case of a husband and
wi fe filing separate returns, subparagraph (A) shall be applied
by substitution "$750" for "$1,500", and by substituting "$1,
500" for "$3,000".

(© Individual s other than taxpayer. -- In the case of any
i ndi vi dual other than the taxpayer, expenses referred to in
subpar agraphs (A) through (D) of paragraph (1) shall be taken



into account only if such individual has both the forner
resi dence and the new residence as his principal place of abode
and is a nenber of the taxpayer's househol d.

(c) conditions for allowance. -- No deduction shall be
al | oned under this section unless --

(1) the taxpayer's new principal place of work --

(A) is at lease 35 mles farther fromhis former residence
than was his former principal place of work, or

(B) if he had no former principal place of work, is at
| ease 35 miles fromhis former residence, and

(2) either --

(A) during the 12-nonth period inmediately follow ng his
arrival in the general location of his new principal place of
wor k, the taxpayer is a full-tinme enployee, in such general
| ocation, during at | ease 39 weeks, or

(B) during the 24-nonth period inmediately follow ng his
arrival in the general |ocation of his new principal place of
wor k, the taxpayer is a full-tinme enployee or perfornms services
as a self-enployed individual on a full-tinme basis, in such
general |ocation, during at | ease 78 weeks, of which not |ess
than 39 weeks are during the 12-nonth period referred to in
subpar agraph (A).

For purposes of paragraph (1), the distance between two
poi nts shall be the shortest of the nore commonly travel ed routes
bet ween such two points.

(d) Rules for application of subsection (c)(2). --

(1) The condition of subsection (c)(2) shall not apply if
the taxpayer is unable to satisfy such condition by reason of --

(A) death or disability, or

(B) involuntary separation (other than for willfu
m sconduct) fromthe service of, or transfer for the benefit of,
an enpl oyer after obtaining full-tinme enploynent in which the
t axpayer coul d reasonably have been expected to satisfy such
condi ti on.

(2) |If a taxpayer has not satisfied the condition of
subsection (c)(2) before the tine prescribed by [ aw (including
extensions thereof) for filing the return for the taxable year
during which he paid or incurred noving expenses which would
ot herwi se be deducti bl e under this section, but may still satisfy
such condition, then such expenses may (at the el ection of the
t axpayer) be deducted for such taxable year notw thstandi ng
subsection (c)(2).

(3) If --

(A) for any taxable year noving expenses have been deducted
in accordance with the rule provided in paragraph (2), and

(B) the condition of subsection (c)(2) cannot be satisfied
at the close of a subsequent taxable year,

then an anmount equal to the expenses which were so deducted
shal |l be included in gross incone for the first such subsequent
t axabl e year.

(3) Denial of double benefit. -- The anount realized on the
sal e of the residence described in subparagraph (A) of subsection
(B)(2) shall not be decreased by the anpbunt of any expenses
described in such subparagraph which are all owed as a deduction
under subsection (a), and the basis of a residence described in



subparagraph (B) of subsection (b)(2) shall not be increased by

t he amount of any expenses described in such subparagraph which
are all owed as a deduction under subsection (a). This subsection
shall not apply to any expenses with respect to which an anount
is included in gross income under subsection (d)(3).

(f) Rules for self-enployed individuals. --

(1) Definition. -- For purposes of this section, the term
"sel f-enpl oyed individual" nmeans an individual who perforns
personal services --

(A) as the owner of the entire interest in an
uni ncor porated trade or business, or

(B) as a partner in a partnership carrying on a trade or
busi ness.

(2) Rule for application of subsections (b)(1)(C and (D)

For purposes of subparagraphs (C) and (D) of subsection (b)
(1), an individual who comences work at a new principal place of
wor k as a sel f-enployed individual shall be treated as having
obt ai ned enpl oynent when he has made substantial arrangenents to
comrence such work.

(g) Rules for nmenbers of the Arnmed Forces of the United
States. -- In the case of a nenber of the Armed Forces of the
United States on active duty who noves pursuant to a mlitary
order and incident to a permanent change of station --

(1) the limtations under subsection (c) shall not apply;

(2) any noving and storage expenses which are furnished in
kind (or for which reinbursement or an all owance is provided, but
only to the extent of the expenses paid or incurred) to such
menber, his spouse, or his dependents, shall not be includible in
gross income, and no reporting with respect to such expenses
shal |l be require by the Secretary of Defense or the Secretary of
Transportation, as the case nmay be; and

(3) if noving and storage expenses are furnished in kind
(or if reinmbursenment or an allowance for such expenses is
provi ded) to such nenber's spouse and his dependents with regard
to noving to a | ocation other than the one to which such nenber
noves (or froma |l ocation other than the one from which such
menber noves), this section shall apply with respect to the
novi ng expenses of his spouse and dependents --

(A) as if his spouse commenced work as an enpl oyee at a new
principal place of work at such | ocation;

(B) for purposes of subsection (b)(3), as if such place of
wor k was wi thin the sane general |ocation as the nenber's new
principal place of work, and

(C wthout regard to the limtations under subsection (c)

(h) special rules for foreign noves. --

(1) Increase in limtations. -- In the case of a foreign
nove - -

(A) subsection (b)(1)(D) shall be applied by substituting
"90 consecutive days" for "30 consecutive days",

(B) subsection (b)(3)(A) shall be applied by substituting
"$4,500" for" $1,500" and by substituting "$6,000" for "$3,000",
and



(C© subsection (b)(3)(B) shall be applied as if the | ast
sentence of such subsection read as follows: "In the case of a
husband and wife filing separate returns, subparagraph (A) shal
be applied by substituting
'$2,250" for '$4,500', and by substituting '$3,000" for '$6,
000' . "

(2) Allowance of certain storage fees. -- In the case of a
f orei gn nove, for purposes of this section, the nobving expenses
described in subsection (b)(1)(A) include the reasonabl e expenses

(A) of noving househol d goods and personal effects to and
from st orage, and

(B) of storing such goods and effects for part or all of
t he period during which the new place of work continues to be the
t axpayer's principal place of work.

(3) foreign nove. -- For purposes of this subsection, the
term"foreign nove" neans the commencenent of work by the
t axpayer at a new principal place of work | ocated outside the
United states.

(4) United States defined. -- for purposes of this
subsection and subsection (i), the term"United States" includes
t he possessions of the United States.

(1) Allowance of deductions in case of retirees or
decedents who were working abroad. --

(1) In general. -- In the case of any qualified retiree
novi ng expenses or qualified survivor noving expenses --

(A) this section (other than subsection (h)) shall be
applied with respect to such expenses as if they were incurred in
connection with the conmmencenent of work by the taxpayer as an
enpl oyee at a new principal place of work |ocated within the
United States, and

(B) the limtation of subsection (c)(2) shall not apply.

(2) Qualified retiree noving expenses. -- For purposes of
paragraph (1), the term"qualified retiree noving expenses" means
any novi ng expenses --

(A) which are paid or incurred by the spouse or any
dependent of any decedent who (as of the tinme of his death) had a
principal place of work outside the United States, and

(B) which are incurred for a nove which begins within 6
nmont hs after the death of such decedent and which is to a
residence in the United States froma fornmer residence outside
the United States which (as of the tinme of the decedent's death)
was t he residence of such decedent and the individual paying or
i ncurring the expense.

(j) Regulations. -- The Secretary shall prescribe such
regul ations as nay be necessary to carry out the purposes of this
secti on.

219. Retirenent savings

(a) Allowance of deduction. -- In the case of an
i ndi vidual, there shall be allowed as a deduction an anount equal
to the qualified retirenment contributions of the individual for
t he taxabl e year.

(b) Maxi mum anount of deduction. --



(1) 1In general. -- the anount allowable as a deduction
under subsection (a) to any individual for any taxable year shal
not exceed the | esser of --

(A $2,000, or

(B) an anpbunt equal to the conpensation includible in the
i ndi vidual's gross inconme for such taxable year.

(2) Special rule for enployer contributions under

sinplified enpl oyee pensions. -- This section shall not apply
Wi th respect to an enployer contribution to a sinplified enployee
pensi on.

(3) Plans under section 501(c)(18). -- Notwi thstanding

paragraph (1), the anount allowable as a deduction under
subsection (a) with respect to any contributions on behalf of an
enpl oyee to a plan described in section 501(c)(18) shall not
exceed the | esser of --

(A $7,000, or

(B) an anpbunt equal to 25 percent of the conpensation (as
defined in section 415 (c)(3)) includible in the individual's
gross inconme for such taxable year.

(c) Special rule for certain married individuals. --

(1) In general. -- In the case of any individual with
respect to whom a deduction is otherw se all owabl e under
subsection (a) --

(A) who files a joint return under section 6013 for a
t axabl e year, and (B) whose spouse --

(1) has no conpensation (determ ned without regard to
section 911) for the taxable year, or

(i1i) elects to be treated for purposes of subsection (b)
(1) (B) as having no conpensation for the taxable year,

there shall be allowed as a deduction any anobunt paid in
cash for the taxable year by or on behalf of the individual to an
i ndi vidual retirement plan established for the benefit of his
spouse.

(2) Limtation. -- The anount allowable as a deduction
under paragraph (1) shall not exceed the excess of --

(A) the |esser of --

(i) $2,250, or

(i1) an amount equal to the conpensation includible in the
i ndividual's gross incone for the taxable year, over

(B) the amount all owabl e as a deduction under subsection
(a) for the taxable year.

In no event shall the anmount allowable as a deduction under
par agraph (1) exceed $2, 000.

(d) Oher Iimtations and restrictions. --

(1) Beneficiary nust be under age 70 1/2. -- No deduction
shal | be allowed under this section with respect to any qualified
retirement contribution for the benefit of an individual if such
i ndi vidual has attained age 70 1/2 before the close of such
i ndi vidual's taxable year for which the contribution was nade.

(2) Recontributed anpbunts. -- No deduction shall be all owed
under this section with respect to a rollover contribution
described in section 402(a)(5), 402(a)(7), 403(a)(4), 403(b)(8),
or 408(d)(3).

(3) Anmounts contributed under endownent contract. -- In the
case of an endowrent contract described in section 408(b), no



deduction shall be allowed under this section for that portion of
t he amounts paid under the contract for the taxable year which is
properly allocable, under regulations prescribed by the
Secretary, to the cost of life insurance.

(4) Denial of deduction for anmount contributed to inherited
annuities or accounts. -- No deduction shall be allowed under
this section with respect to any anmount paid to an inherited
i ndi vidual retirement account or individual retirement annuity
(within the meani ng of section
408(d) (3)(C) (ii).

(e) Qualified retirenment contribution. -- For purposes of
this section, the term"qualified retirenent contribution” neans

(1) any amount paid in cash for the taxable year by or on
behal f of an individual to an individual retirenment plan for such
i ndi vi dual s benefit, and

(2) any amount contributed on behalf of any individual to a
pl an described in section 501(c)(18).

(f) Oher definitions and special rules. --

(1) Conpensation. -- For purposes of this section, the term
"conpensation” includes earned incone (as defined in section 401
(c)(2)). The term "conpensation” dos not include any anount
received as a pension or annuity and does not include any anount
recei ved as deferred conpensation. The term "conpensation" shal
i ncl uded any amount includible in the
i ndi vidual's gross inconme under section 71 with respect to a
di vorce or separation instrument described in subparagraph (A) of
section 71(b)(2). For purposes of this paragraph, section 401
(c)(2) shall be applied as if the termtrade or business for
pur poses of section 1402 included service described in subsection
(c)(6).

(2) Married individuals. -- The maxi mum deducti on under
subsections (b) and (c) shall be conputed separately for each
i ndi vidual, and this section shall be applied without regard to
any community property | aws.

(3) Tine when contributions deenmed nmade. -- For purposes of
this section, a taxpayer shall be deened to have nmade a
contribution to an individual retirenment plan on the | ast day of
t he precedi ng taxable year if the contributions nade on account
of such taxable year and is nade not |ater than tine prescribed
by law for filing the return for such taxable year (not including
ext ensi ons thereof).

(4) Reports. -- The Secretary shall prescribe regul ations
whi ch prescribe the tine and the nmanner in which reports to the
Secretary and plan participants shall be made by the plan
adm ni strator of a qualified enployer or governnent plan
receiving qualified voluntary enpl oyee contri buti ons.

(5) Enployer paynents. -- For purposes of this title, any
amount paid by an enpl oyer to an individual retirenment plan shal
be treated as paynment of conpensation to the enpl oyee (other than
a sel f-enpl oyed individual who is an enpl oyee within the neaning
of section 401(c)(1))
includible in his gross income in the taxable year for which the
amount was contri buted, whether or not a deduction for such
paynment is allowable under this section to the enpl oyee.



(6) Excess contributions treated as contribution made
during subsequent year for which there is an unused limtation. -
(A In general. -- If for the taxable year the maxi mum

amount al | owabl e as a deduction under this section for
contributions to an individual retirenment plan exceeds the anount
contributed, then the taxpayer shall be treated as havi ng made an
addi tional contribution for the taxable year in an anmount equal
to the | esser of --

(1) the amount of such excess, or

(i11) the anmobunt of the excess contributions for such
t axabl e year (determ ned under section 4973(b)(2) w thout regard
t o subparagraph (c) thereof).

(B) Amount contributed. -- For purposes of this paragraph,
the anobunt contributed --

(i) shall be determ ned without regard to this paragraph,
and

(i1i) shall not include any rollover contribution.

(C Special rule where excess deduction was allowed for
cl osed year. -- Proper reduction shall be made in the anount
al | owabl e as a deduction by reason of this paragraph for any
amount al | owabl e as a deduction under this section for a prior
t axabl e year for which the period for assessing deficiency has
expired if the amount so all owed exceeds the anount which should
have been all owed for such prior taxable year.

(7) Election not to deduct contributions. --

For el ection not to deduct contributions to individual
retirement plans, see section 408(0)(2)(B)(ii).

(g0 Limtation on deduction for active participants in
certain pension plans. --

(1) 1In general. -- If (for any part of any plan year ending
With or wwthin a taxable year) an individual or the individual's
spouse is an active participant, each of the dollar Iimtations
contained in subsections (b)(1)(A) and (c)(2) for such taxable
year shall be reduced (but not bel ow zero) by the anount
det er mi ned under paragraph (2).

(2) Amount of reduction. --

(A) In general. -- The anount determ ned under this
paragraph with respect to any dollar limtation shall be the
amount whi ch bears the sane ratio to such limtation as --

(i) the excess of --

(I') the taxpayer's adjusted gross incone for such taxable
year, over

(I'1) the applicable dollar anpbunt, bears to

(ii) $10,000.

(B) No reduction bel ow $200 until conpl ete phase-out. -- No
dollar limtation shall be reduced bel ow $200 under paragraph (1)
unl ess (without regard to this subparagraph) such [imtation is
reduced to zero.

(© rounding. -- Any anmount determ ned under this paragraph
which is not a multiple of $10 shall be rounded to the next
| onest $10.

(3) Adjusted gross incone; applicable dollar amount. -- For
pur poses of this subsection --



(A) Adjusted gross inconme. -- Adjusted gross inconme of any
t axpayer shall be determ ned --

(1) after application of sections 86 and 469, and

(1) wthout regard to sections 135 and 911 or the
deduction al |l owabl e under this section.

(B) Applicable dollar amount. -- The term "applicable
dol I ar amount” neans --

(i) in the case of a taxpayer filing a joint return $40,

000,

(ii) in the case of any other taxpayer (other than a
married individual filing a separate return), $25,000, and

(tiit) in the case of a married individual filing a separate

return, zero
(4) Special rule for married individuals filing separately

and living apart. -- A husband and wi fe who --
(A) file separate returns for any taxable year, and
(B) live apart at all tinmes during such taxable year, shal

not be treated as married individuals for purposes of this
subsecti on.

(5) Active participant. -- For purposes of this subsection,
the term"active participant” nmeans, with respect to any plan
year, an individual --

(A) who is an active participant in --

(i) a plan described in section 401(a) which includes a
trust exenpt fromtax under section 501(a),

(1i) an annuity plan described in section 403(a),

(ti1) a plan established for its enpl oyees by the United
States, by a State or political subdivision thereof, or by an
agency or instrunmentality of any of the foregoing,

(iv) an annuity contract described in section 403(b), or

(v) a sinplified enployee pension (wthin the neaning of
section 501(c)(18).

The determ nation of whether an individual is an active
partici pant shall be made without regard to whether or not such
I ndividual's rights under a plan, trust, or contract are
nonforfeitable. An eligible deferred conpensation plan (wthin
t he nmeani ng of section 457(b)) shall not be treated as a plan
descri bed i n subparagraph (A)(iii).

(6) Certain individuals not treated as active participants.
-- For purposes of this subsection, any individual described in
any of the follow ng subparagraphs shall not be treated as an
active participant for any taxable year solely because of any
participation so descri bed:

(A) Menbers of reserve conmponents. -- Participation in a
pl an described in subparagraph (A)(iii) of paragraph (5) by
reason of service as a nenber of a reserve conponent of the Arned
Forces (as defined in section 261(a) of title 10), unless such
i ndi vi dual has served in excess of 90 days on active duty (other
than active duty for training) during the year.

(B) Volunteer firefighters. -- A volunteer firefighter --
(i) who is a participant in a plan described in
subpar agr aph
(A)(iii) of paragraph (5) based on his activity as a vol unteer
firefighter, and



(i1i) whose accrued benefit as of the beginning of the
taxabl e year is not nore than an annual benefit of $1,800 (when
expressed as a single life annuity conmenci ng at age 65).

241. Al owance of special deductions

In addition to the deductions provided in part VI (sec. 161
and followi ng), there shall be allowed as deductions in conputing
taxabl e income the itens specified in this part.

243. Dividends received by corporations

(a) GCeneral rule. -- In the case of a corporation, there
shal |l be allowed as a deduction an amount equal to the follow ng
percent ages of the anount received as dividends froma donestic
corporation which is subject to taxation under this chapter:

(1) 70 percent, in the case of dividends and other than
di vi dends descri bed in paragraph (2) or (3);

(2) 100 percent, in the case of dividends received by a
smal | busi ness investnent conpany operating under the Snal
Busi ness I nvestnent Act of 1958 (15 U.S.C. 661 and foll ow ng);
and

(3) 100 percent, in the case of qualifying dividends (as
defined in subsection (b)(1)).

(b) Qualifying dividends. --

(1) In general. -- for purposes of this section, the term
"qual i fyi ng dividend" neans dividend received by a corporation -

(A if at the close of the day on which such dividend is
received, such corporation is a nmenber of the sane affiliated
group as the corporation distributing such dividend, and

(B) if --

(1) such dividend is distributed out of the earnings and
profits of a taxable year of the distributing corporation which
ends after decenmber 31, 1963, for which an el ection under section
1562 was not in effect, and on each day of which the distributing
corporation and the corporation receiving the dividend were
menbers of such affiliated group, or

(1i) such dividend is paid by a corporation with respect to
whi ch an el ection under section 936 is in effect for the taxable
year in which such dividend is paid.

(2) Affiliated group. -- For purposes of this subsection,
the term"affiliated group” has the nmeaning given such term by
section 1504(a), except that for such purposes sections 1504(b)
(2), 1504 (b)(4), and 1504 (c) shall not apply.

(3) special rule for groups which include life insurance
conpani es. --

(A) In general. -- In the case an affiliated group which
i ncludes 1 or nore insurance conpani es under section 801, no
di vidend by any nmenber of such group shall be treated as a
qual i fying dividend unless an el ection under this paragraph is in
effect for the taxable year in which the dividend is received.
The precedi ng sentence shall not apply in the case of a dividend
descri bed in paragraph (1)(B)(ii).

(B) Effect of election. -- If an election under this
paragraph is in effect with respect of any affiliated group --



(1) part Il of subchapter B of chapter 6 (relating to
certain controlled corporations) shall be applied with respect to
t he menbers of such group without regard to sections 1563(a)(4)
and 1563(b)(2) (D), and

(1i) for purposes of this subsection, a distribution by any
menber of such group which is subject to tax under section 801
shall not be treated as a qualifying dividend if such
distribution is out of earnings and profits for a taxable year
for which an election under this paragraph is not effective and
f or which such distributing corporation was not a conmponent
menber of a controlled group of corporations within the nmeaning
of section 1563 solely by reason of section 1563(b)(2)(D

(C Election. -- An election under this paragraph shall be
made by the comon parent of the affiliated group and at such
time and in such manner as the Secretary shall by regul ations
prescribe. Any such election shall be binding on all nenbers of
such group and nay be revoked only with the consent of the
Secretary.

(c) Retention of 80-percent dividend received froma 20-
percent owned corporation --

(A) subsection (a)(1l) of this section, and

(B) subsection (a)(3) and (b)(2) of section 244,

shal |l be applied by substituting "80 percent” for "70
percent".

(2) 20-Percent owned corporation. -- For purposes of
subsection (a) --

(1) Any armount allowed as a deduction under section 591
(relating to deduction for dividends paid by nutual savings
banks, etc.) shall not be treated as a dividend.

(2) A dividend received froma regul ated i nvestment conpany
shal |l be subject to the |imtations prescribed in section 854.

(3) Any dividend received froma real estate investnent
trust which, for the taxable year of the trust in which the
dividend is paid, qualifies under part Il of subchapter M
(section 856 and follow ng) shall not be treated as a dividend.

(4) any dividend received which is described in section 244
(relating to dividends received on preferred stock of a public
utility) shall not be treated as a dividend.

(e) Certain dividends fromforeign corporations. -- For
pur poses of subsection (a) and for purposes of section 245, any
di vidend froma foreign corporation fromearnings and profits
accunul ated by a domestic corporation during a period with
respect to which such donestic corporation was subject to
taxation under this chapter (or correspondi ng provisions of prior
| aw) shall be treated as a dividend froma donmestic corporation
whi ch is subject to taxation under this chapter.



